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Patrick, Kim

From: Patrick, Kim TATE 30ARD IF b CTIONS
Sent: Monday, September 09, 2013 10:48 AM .

To: Patrick, Kim 13SEP -9 AMI0: 58
Subject: FW: A-1 Adjustments

From: Cathy Madaus [mailto:cmadaus@iar.org]
Sent: Monday, September 09, 2013 10:45 AM

To: Patrick, Kim
Subject: A-1 Adjustments

Kim,

We had to adjust two A-1's:
Chris Read contributed $1.030 - But an A-1 was submitted for $2,000 in Error. (04/18/2013)
Nancy Dahlberg contributed $248.00 - but an A-1 was submitted for $1.691.50 in error. (06/07/2013)

These were both clerical errors. Sorry for the inconvenience.,

Cathy Madaus

Accounting Manager
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